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information cybersecurity. ISO/IEC
27032 IT Governance Publishing
This book encourages cybersecurity
professionals to take a wider view of
what cybersecurity means, and to
exploit international standards and best
practice to create a culture of
cybersecurity awareness within their
organization that supplements
technology-based defenses.
Cyber Crisis Management IGI Global
Until recently, if it has been considered
at all in the context of business
continuity, cyber security may have
been thought of in terms of disaster
recovery and little else. Recent events
have shown that cyber-attacks are now
an everyday occurrence, and it is
becoming clear that the impact of these
can have devastating effects on

organizations whether large or small,
public or private sector. Cyber security is
one aspect of information security, since
the impacts or consequences of a cyber-
attack will inevitably damage one or
more of the three pillars of information
security: the confidentiality, integrity or
availability of an organization’s
information assets. The main difference
between information security and cyber
security is that while information
security deals with all types of
information assets, cyber security deals
purely with those which are accessible
by means of interconnected electronic
networks, including the Internet. Many
responsible organizations now have
robust information security, business
continuity and disaster recovery
programs in place, and it is not the
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intention of this book to re-write those,
but to inform organizations about the
kind of precautions they should take to
stave off successful cyber-attacks and
how they should deal with them when
they arise in order to protect the day-to-
day businesses.
Proceedings of the 8th International
Workshop Soft Computing Applications
(SOFA 2018), Vol. I Stylus Publishing, LLC
In today?s globalized world, businesses
and governments rely heavily on
technology for storing and protecting
essential information and data. Despite
the benefits that computing systems
offer, there remains an assortment of
issues and challenges in maintaining the
integrity and confidentiality of these
databases. As professionals become
more dependent cyberspace, there is a

need for research on modern strategies
and concepts for improving the security
and safety of these technologies. Modern
Theories and Practices for Cyber Ethics
and Security Compliance is a collection
of innovative research on the concepts,
models, issues, challenges, innovations,
and mitigation strategies needed to
improve cyber protection. While
highlighting topics including database
governance, cryptography, and intrusion
detection, this book provides guidelines
for the protection, safety, and security of
business data and national infrastructure
from cyber-attacks. It is ideally designed
for security analysts, law enforcement,
researchers, legal practitioners,
policymakers, business professionals,
governments, strategists, educators, and
students seeking current research on
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combative solutions for cyber threats
and attacks.
National Security: Breakthroughs in
Research and Practice Syngress
Written for IT service managers,
consultants and other practitioners in IT
governance, risk and compliance, this
practical book discusses all the key
concepts of COBIT®5, and explains how
to direct the governance of enterprise IT
(GEIT) using the COBIT®5 framework.
The book also covers the main
frameworks and standards supporting
GEIT, discusses the ideas of enterprise
and governance, and shows the path
from corporate governance to the
governance of enterprise IT.
Industry 4.0 for the Built Environment
Van Haren
The tactical organization and protection

of resources is a vital component for any
governmental entity. Effectively
managing national security through
various networks ensures the highest
level of protection and defense for
citizens and classified information.
National Security: Breakthroughs in
Research and Practice is an authoritative
resource for the latest research on the
multiple dimensions of national security,
including the political, physical,
economic, ecological, and computational
dimensions. Highlighting a range of
pertinent topics such as data breaches,
surveillance, and threat detection, this
publication is an ideal reference source
for government officials, law
enforcement, professionals, researchers,
IT professionals, academicians, and
graduate-level students seeking current
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research on the various aspects of
national security.
Handbook of Research on
Multidisciplinary Approaches to
Entrepreneurship, Innovation, and ICTs
Legend Press
This book is intended for everyone in an
organization who wishes to have a basic
understanding of information security.
Knowledge about information security is
important to all employees. It makes no
difference if you work in a profit- or non-
profit organization because the risks that
organizations face are similar for all
organizations.It clearly explains the
approaches that most organizations can
consider and implement which helps
turn Information Security management
into an approachable, effective and well-
understood tool. It covers: The quality

requirements an organization may have
for information; The risks associated with
these quality requirements; The
countermeasures that are necessary to
mitigate these risks; Ensuring business
continuity in the event of a disaster;
When and whether to report incidents
outside the organization.The information
security concepts in this revised edition
are based on the ISO/IEC27001:2013 and
ISO/IEC27002:2013 standards. But the
text also refers to the other relevant
international standards for information
security. The text is structured as
follows: Fundamental Principles of
Security and Information security and
Risk management. Architecture,
processes and information, needed for
basic understanding of what information
security is about. Business Assets are
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discussed. Measures that can be taken
to protect information assets. (Physical
measures, technical measures and
finally the organizational measures.)The
primary objective of this book is to
achieve awareness by students who
want to apply for a basic information
security examination. It is a source of
information for the lecturer who wants to
question information security students
about their knowledge. Each chapter
ends with a case study. In order to help
with the understanding and coherence of
each subject, these case studies include
questions relating to the areas covered
in the relevant chapters. Examples of
recent events that illustrate the
vulnerability of information are also
included.This book is primarily
developed as a study book for anyone

who wants to pass the ISFS (Information
Security Foundation) exam of EXIN. In an
appendix an ISFS model exam is given,
with feedback to all multiple choice
options, so that it can be used as a
training for the real ISFS exam.
Research Anthology on Artificial
Intelligence Applications in Security
IGI Global
Van Haren Publishing is the world’s
leading publisher in best practice,
methods and standards within IT
Management, Project Management,
Enterprise Architecture and Business
Management. We are the official
publisher for some of the world’s leading
organizations and their frameworks
including: The Open Group [TOGAF],
IPMA-NL, ITSqc [eSCM Models],
GamingWorks [ABC of ICT], ASL BiSL
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Foundation, IAOP®, IACCM, CRP Henri
Tudor and PMI NL. This catalog will
provide you with an overview of our
most popular and upcoming titles, but
also gives you a quality summary on
internationally relevant frameworks. Van
Haren Publishing is an independent,
worldwide recognized publisher, well
known for our extensive professional
network (authors, reviewers and
accreditation bodies of standards),
flexibility and years of experience. We
make content available in hard copy and
digital formats, designed to suit your
personal preference (iPad, Kindle and
online), available through over 50
distribution partners (Amazon, Google
Play, Barnes & Noble, Managementboek
and Bol.com, etc.) and over 700 outlets
worldwide. Free whitepapers are

available in our eKnowledge, with a
licence for our eLibrary you can
download all our eBooks within your area
of expertise and in our eShop you can
place your order in your favorite media
format: hard copy or eBook.
2014 International Conference on
Mechanical Engineering and Automation
(ICMEA2014) Academic Conferences and
publishing limited
As industries are rapidly being digitalized
and information is being more heavily
stored and transmitted online, the
security of information has become a top
priority in securing the use of online
networks as a safe and effective
platform. With the vast and diverse
potential of artificial intelligence (AI)
applications, it has become easier than
ever to identify cyber vulnerabilities,
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potential threats, and the identification
of solutions to these unique problems.
The latest tools and technologies for AI
applications have untapped potential
that conventional systems and human
security systems cannot meet, leading AI
to be a frontrunner in the fight against
malware, cyber-attacks, and various
security issues. However, even with the
tremendous progress AI has made within
the sphere of security, it’s important to
understand the impacts, implications,
and critical issues and challenges of AI
applications along with the many
benefits and emerging trends in this
essential field of security-based
research. Research Anthology on
Artificial Intelligence Applications in
Security seeks to address the
fundamental advancements and

technologies being used in AI
applications for the security of digital
data and information. The included
chapters cover a wide range of topics
related to AI in security stemming from
the development and design of these
applications, the latest tools and
technologies, as well as the utilization of
AI and what challenges and impacts
have been discovered along the way.
This resource work is a critical
exploration of the latest research on
security and an overview of how AI has
impacted the field and will continue to
advance as an essential tool for security,
safety, and privacy online. This book is
ideally intended for cyber security
analysts, computer engineers, IT
specialists, practitioners, stakeholders,
researchers, academicians, and students
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interested in AI applications in the realm
of security research.
Springer
In recent years, industries have
transitioned into the digital realm, as
companies and organizations are
adopting certain forms of technology to
assist in information storage and
efficient methods of production. This
dependence has significantly increased
the risk of cyber crime and breaches in
data security. Fortunately, research in
the area of cyber security and
information protection is flourishing;
however, it is the responsibility of
industry professionals to keep pace with
the current trends within this field. The
Handbook of Research on Cyber Crime
and Information Privacy is a collection of
innovative research on the modern

methods of crime and misconduct within
cyber space. It presents novel solutions
to securing and preserving digital
information through practical examples
and case studies. While highlighting
topics including virus detection,
surveillance technology, and social
networks, this book is ideally designed
for cybersecurity professionals,
researchers, developers, practitioners,
programmers, computer scientists,
academicians, security analysts,
educators, and students seeking up-to-
date research on advanced approaches
and developments in cyber security and
information protection.
Soft Computing Applications IGI Global
This book introduces unmanned aircraft
systems traffic management (UTM) and
how this new paradigm in traffic



10

10 Iso Iec 27032 2012 Information Technology Security 2022-09-16

management integrates unmanned
aircraft operations into national airspace
systems. Exploring how UTM is expected
to operate, including possible
architectures for UTM implementations,
and UTM services, including flight
planning, strategic coordination, and
conformance monitoring, Unmanned
Aircraft Systems Traffic Management:
UTM considers the boundaries of UTM
and how it is expected to interlace with
tactical coordination systems to maintain
airspace safety. The book also presents
the work of the global ecosystem of
players advancing UTM, including
relevant standards development
organizations (SDOs), and considers UTM
governance paradigms and challenges.
FEATURES Describes UTM concept of
operations (ConOps) and global

variations in architectures Explores
envisioned UTM services, including flight
planning, strategic coordination,
conformance monitoring, contingency
management, constraints and geo-
awareness, and remote identification
Highlights cybersecurity standards
development and awareness Covers
approaches to the approval,
management, and oversight of UTM
components and ecosystem Considers
the future of UTM and potential barriers
to its success, international coordination,
and regulatory reform This book is an
essential, in-depth, annotated resource
for developers, unmanned aircraft
system operators, pilots, policy makers,
researchers, and academics engaged in
unmanned systems, transportation
management, and the future of aviation.
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13th IFIP WG 11.8 World Conference,
WISE 13, Maribor, Slovenia, September
21–23, 2020, Proceedings CRC Press
Cybersecurity is vital for all businesses,
regardless of sector. With constant
threats and potential online dangers,
businesses must remain aware of the
current research and information
available to them in order to protect
themselves and their employees.
Maintaining tight cybersecurity can be
difficult for businesses as there are so
many moving parts to contend with, but
remaining vigilant and having protective
measures and training in place is
essential for a successful company. The
Research Anthology on Business Aspects
of Cybersecurity considers all emerging
aspects of cybersecurity in the business
sector including frameworks, models,

best practices, and emerging areas of
interest. This comprehensive reference
source is split into three sections with
the first discussing audits and risk
assessments that businesses can
conduct to ensure the security of their
systems. The second section covers
training and awareness initiatives for
staff that promotes a security culture.
The final section discusses software and
systems that can be used to secure and
manage cybersecurity threats. Covering
topics such as audit models, security
behavior, and insider threats, it is ideal
for businesses, business professionals,
managers, security analysts, IT
specialists, executives, academicians,
researchers, computer engineers,
graduate students, and practitioners.
An i-depth guide to the role of standards
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in the cybersecurity environment
Springer
Information Security and Optimization
maintains a practical perspective while
offering theoretical explanations. The
book explores concepts that are
essential for academics as well as
organizations. It discusses aspects of
techniques and tools—definitions, usage,
and analysis—that are invaluable for
scholars ranging from those just
beginning in the field to established
experts. What are the policy standards?
What are vulnerabilities and how can
one patch them? How can data be
transmitted securely? How can data in
the cloud or cryptocurrency in the
blockchain be secured? How can
algorithms be optimized? These are
some of the possible queries that are

answered here effectively using
examples from real life and case studies.
Features: A wide range of case studies
and examples derived from real-life
scenarios that map theoretical
explanations with real incidents.
Descriptions of security tools related to
digital forensics with their unique
features, and the working steps for
acquiring hands-on experience. Novel
contributions in designing organization
security policies and lightweight
cryptography. Presentation of real-world
use of blockchain technology and
biometrics in cryptocurrency and
personalized authentication systems.
Discussion and analysis of security in the
cloud that is important because of
extensive use of cloud services to meet
organizational and research demands
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such as data storage and computing
requirements. Information Security and
Optimization is equally helpful for
undergraduate and postgraduate
students as well as for researchers
working in the domain. It can be
recommended as a reference or
textbook for courses related to
cybersecurity.
Executing Social Engineering Pen Tests,
Assessments and Defense IGI Global
From Internet of Things to Smart Cities:
Enabling Technologies explores the
information and communication
technologies (ICT) needed to enable
real-time responses to current
environmental, technological, societal,
and economic challenges. ICT
technologies can be utilized to help with
reducing carbon emissions, improving

resource utilization efficiency, promoting
active engagement of citizens, and
more. This book aims to introduce the
latest ICT technologies and to promote
international collaborations across the
scientific community, and eventually, the
general public. It consists of three tightly
coupled parts. The first part explores the
involvement of enabling technologies
from basic machine-to-machine
communications to Internet of Things
technologies. The second part of the
book focuses on state of the art data
analytics and security techniques, and
the last part of the book discusses the
design of human-machine interfaces,
including smart home and cities.
Features Provides an extended literature
review of relevant technologies, in
addition to detailed comparison



14

14 Iso Iec 27032 2012 Information Technology Security 2022-09-16

diagrams, making new readers be easier
to grasp fundamental and wide
knowledge Contains the most recent
research results in the field of
communications, signal processing and
computing sciences for facilitating smart
homes, buildings, and cities Includes
future research directions in Internet of
Things, smart homes, smart buildings,
smart grid, and smart cities Presents real
examples of applying these enabling
technologies to smart homes,
transportation systems and cities With
contributions from leading experts, the
book follows an easy structure that not
only presents timely research topics in-
depth, but also integrates them into real
world applications to help readers to
better understand them.
Social Engineering Penetration Testing

John Wiley & Sons
International StandardInformation
technology. Security techniques.
Guidelines for information cybersecurity.
ISO/IEC 27032CyberWar, CyberTerror,
CyberCrime and CyberActivismAn i-
depth guide to the role of standards in
the cybersecurity environmentIT
Governance Publishing
Recent Advances in Information and
Communication Technology 2015 IT
Governance Ltd
This book presents the proceedings of
the 8th International Workshop on Soft
Computing Applications, SOFA 2018,
held on 13–15 September 2018 in Arad,
Romania. The workshop was organized
by Aurel Vlaicu University of Arad, in
conjunction with the Institute of
Computer Science, Iasi Branch of the
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Romanian Academy, IEEE Romanian
Section, Romanian Society of Control
Engineering and Technical Informatics –
Arad Section, General Association of
Engineers in Romania – Arad Section and
BTM Resources Arad. The papers
included in these proceedings, published
post-conference, cover the research
including Knowledge-Based Technologies
for Web Applications, Cloud Computing,
Security Algorithms and Computer
Networks, Business Process
Management, Computational Intelligence
in Education and Modelling and
Applications in Textiles and many other
areas related to the Soft Computing. The
book is directed to professors,
researchers, and graduate students in
area of soft computing techniques and
applications.

Governance of Enterprise IT based on
COBIT 5 CRC Press
This book constitutes the refereed
proceedings of the 8th IFIP WG 11.8
World Conference on Security Education,
WISE 8, held in Auckland, New Zealand,
in July 2013. It also includes papers from
WISE 6, held in Bento Gonçalves, Brazil,
in July 2009 and WISE 7, held in Lucerne,
Switzerland in June 2011. The 34 revised
papers presented were carefully
reviewed and selected for inclusion in
this volume. They represent a cross
section of applicable research as well as
case studies in security education.
Information and Operational Technology
Security Systems IGI Global
This book constitutes the refereed
proceedings of the First International
Workshop, IOSec 2018, sponsored by
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CIPSEC, held in Heraklion, Crete, Greece,
in September 2018. The 12 full papers
presented were carefully reviewed and
selected from 22 submissions. They
were organized in topical sections
named: Critical Infrastructure
Cybersecurity Issues; CyberSecurity
Threats, Assessment and Privacy; and
Vulnerability and Malware Detection.
Business Continuity in a Cyber World
Springer
The ICMEA2014 will provide an excellent
international academic forum for sharing
knowledge and results in theory,
methodology and applications of
Mechanical Engineering and Automation.
The ICMEA2014 is organized by
Advanced Information Science Research
Center (AISRC) and is co-sponsored by
Chongqing University, Changsha

University of Science & Technology,
Huazong University of Science and
Technology and China Three Gorges
University. This ICMEA2014 proceedings
tends to collect the up-to-date,
comprehensive and worldwide state-of-
art knowledge on mechanical
engineering and automation, including
control theory and application, mechanic
manufacturing system and automation,
and Computer Science and applications.
All of accepted papers were subjected to
strict peer-reviewing by 2-4 expert
referees. The papers have been selected
for this volume because of quality and
the relevance to the conference. We
hope this book will not only provide the
readers a broad overview of the latest
research results, but also provide the
readers a valuable summary and
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reference in these fields. ICMEA2014
organizing committee would like to
express our sincere appreciations to all
authors for their contributions to this
book. We would like to extend our
thanks to all the referees for their
constructive comments on all papers;
especially, we would like to thank to
organizing committee for their hard
working.
Enabling Technologies Lulu.com
This book focus on critical infrastructure
protection. The chapters present
detailed analysis of the issues and
challenges in cyberspace and provide
novel solutions in various aspects. The
first part of the book focus on digital
society, addressing critical infrastructure
and different forms of the digitalization,
strategic focus on cyber security, legal

aspects on cyber security, citizen in
digital society, and cyber security
training. The second part focus on the
critical infrastructure protection in
different areas of the critical
infrastructure. The chapters cover the
cybersecurity situation awareness,
aviation and air traffic control, cyber
security in smart societies and cities,
cyber security in smart buildings,
maritime cyber security, cyber security
in energy systems, and cyber security in
healthcare. The third part presents the
impact of new technologies upon cyber
capability building as well as new
challenges brought about by new
technologies. These new technologies
are among others are quantum
technology, firmware and wireless
technologies, malware analysis,
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virtualization.
Smart Cities Van Haren
This book constitutes the proceedings of
the 13th International Conference on
Design Science Research in Information
Systems and Technology, DESRIST 2018,
held in June 2018 in Chennai, India. The
24 full papers presented in this volume

were carefully reviewed and selected
from 96 papers. The contributions are
organized in topical sections named: HCI
and Design, Design Foundations, Design
Foundations, Design in Healthcare,
Advances in Data Science and Analytics,
ICT for Development, Designing
Cybersecurity, and Design Applications.


